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The management and the IQAC coordinate and collect feedback periodically from students through
the process of responding to a questionnaire. They are also informed and given the liberty to submit
their suggestions, grievances and problems anytime during the semester through the complaint box
placed by the Grievance Redressal Committee. The students also give their feedback on the
curriculum through their mentors and the students’ feedbacks are given due consideration. The
feedback from the faculty is obtained through discussions in the departmental level, through self-
appraisal and in faculty meeting. In every area where improvements are required are discussions are
held in respective committees/departments. Feedback from the alumni is solicited through
consultation during alumni association meetings. Feedback from the parents is conveyed in the
Parent Teacher meeting. Suggestions and comments given by the guardians are also taken into
account for future development. The feedback from various stakeholders is collected and
thoroughly discussed and analysed in the appropriate forum. Accordingly, matters that can be
handled independently and personally are forwarded to the concerned individuals or departments to
address the problem by adopting corrective measures. Matters which involve the College as a whole
are dealt by the Principal in coordination with the concerned department through head of
departments or concerned committee. The proposals given by the different committees and
departments are discussed with the Governing Body of the College for necessary action. Strengths
of the College are also taken into consideration for further up gradation.
Curriculum feedback is obtained Online through a well-structured Questionnaire from Students, and
Parents annually. The feedback collected in analysed statistically and data is compiled either at
Department level or at Institutional level. The feedback regarding the curriculum is taken from final
year students which are analyzed at departmental level. On the basis of their suggestions, to enrich
the curriculum delivery, various certificate and short term courses, seminars, workshops, guest
lectures, lecture series, project exhibitions, science fair are conducted to enrich their learning
experience and perform to their maximum potential. Students are also taken for Field /Industrial
visits to bridge the gap between academia and industry. This helps to make the study more practical.
Teacher’s feedback regarding the curriculum too is taken and analysed at Departmental level. It is
compiled communicate to the BOS members and syllabus revision committee members of the
University by mail or during meetings. Data collected is analysed and compiled at Institute level
and necessary suggestions are deliberated. Alumni feedback collected facilitated industry
interaction/ visits and guest lectures by industry experts. Interactions with eminent alumni members
are arranged on regular basis. This has increased our students’ awareness and helped to bridge the
gap between campus to corporate. Another suggestion from alumni was to increase student
involvement in learning by having more students’ presentations/ seminar. Thus feedback provides
opportunity to students and other stakeholders to actively participate in the improvement of
programs of study. It thereby improves the quality of students learning experiences and improves
their curriculum planning and delivery as per the expectations of the stakeholders.
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